
Season Of Blood: A Journey Through The
Rwandan Genocide

In 1994, Rwanda was plunged into a genocide that claimed the lives of
over 800,000 people in just 100 days. The perpetrators were primarily Hutu
extremists, who targeted Tutsi men, women, and children in a systematic
campaign of violence. Immaculée Ilibagiza, a Tutsi woman, was one of the
lucky ones who survived. She hid in a cramped bathroom for 91 days, with
seven other women, as the genocide raged outside.

Season of Blood is Ilibagiza's harrowing and insightful account of her
experience during the genocide. She writes with a raw honesty and
emotion that is both heartbreaking and inspiring. She describes the fear
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and uncertainty she felt as she hid for her life, the guilt she felt for not being
able to save her family and friends, and the hope that kept her going.
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Season of Blood is more than just a memoir. It is a powerful indictment of
the Rwandan government and the international community, who failed to
stop the genocide. It is also a testament to the resilience of the human
spirit. Ilibagiza's story is a reminder that even in the darkest of times, hope
can prevail.

Praise for Season of Blood

"A powerful and moving testimony to the resilience of the human spirit." -
The New York Times

"A harrowing account of the Rwandan genocide that will stay with you long
after you finish reading it." - The Washington Post

"A must-read for anyone who wants to understand the Rwandan genocide
and its aftermath." - The Wall Street Journal
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About the Author

Immaculée Ilibagiza is a Rwandan genocide survivor and human rights
activist. She is the author of the bestselling memoir Season of Blood, which
has been translated into over 20 languages. Ilibagiza has spoken about her
experiences at the United Nations and other international forums. She is a
co-founder of the Imbabazi Foundation, which supports survivors of
genocide and promotes peace and reconciliation.

Free Download Your Copy Today

Season of Blood is available in hardcover, paperback, and e-book formats.
You can Free Download your copy from your favorite bookstore or online
retailer.
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