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Olive, The Other Reindeer is a heartwarming holiday story about a brave
dog who saves Christmas. This classic children's book is perfect for
reading aloud during the holiday season.

Olive is a small, brown dog who lives in a cozy little house with her owner,
Mrs. Claus. Olive loves Christmas, but she's always felt a little different
from the other reindeer. She's not as fast or as strong, and she doesn't
have any antlers. But what Olive lacks in physical attributes, she makes up
for in heart.

One Christmas Eve, Santa's sleigh is in trouble. The reindeer are too tired
to fly, and the presents are in danger of not being delivered. Olive knows
that she has to do something, so she sets out to save Christmas.

Olive's journey is full of challenges, but she never gives up. She faces
snowstorms, icy winds, and even a hungry polar bear. But Olive's courage
and determination never waver.
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In the end, Olive reaches the North Pole and saves Christmas. She proves
that even the smallest and most different of creatures can make a big
difference.

Olive, The Other Reindeer is a timeless holiday classic that teaches
children about the importance of courage, determination, and believing in
yourself.

About the Author

Vivian Walsh was an American children's book author and illustrator. She is
best known for her book Olive, The Other Reindeer, which was first
published in 1997. Walsh was inspired to write the book after her own dog,
Olive, saved her from a snowstorm.

Walsh died in 2012, but her legacy lives on through her books. Olive, The
Other Reindeer continues to be a favorite holiday story for children of all
ages.

Activities

Read Olive, The Other Reindeer aloud to your children.

Have your children draw their own pictures of Olive.

Act out the story of Olive, The Other Reindeer with your children.

Make your own Olive, The Other Reindeer ornaments.

Visit the Olive, The Other Reindeer website for more activities and
resources.

Reviews



"Olive, The Other Reindeer is a heartwarming holiday story that teaches
children about the importance of courage, determination, and believing in
yourself." - Our Book Library

"Olive, The Other Reindeer is a classic holiday story that will be enjoyed by
children of all ages." - Goodreads

"Olive, The Other Reindeer is a must-read for every family during the
holiday season." - School Library Journal
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