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40th Anniversary Edition

In this special 40th anniversary edition of his groundbreaking work, James
Macgregor Burns offers a comprehensive exploration of leadership that is
as relevant and inspiring today as it was when it was first published.

Drawing on a wide range of historical and contemporary examples, Burns
argues that leadership is not simply a matter of power and authority, but a
complex and often transformative process that involves both leaders and
followers. He identifies two distinct types of leadership: transactional
leadership, which is based on exchanges of rewards and punishments, and
transformational leadership, which is based on shared values and a
common vision.

Burns argues that transformational leadership is the more effective and
sustainable form of leadership, as it is able to inspire and motivate
followers to achieve extraordinary results. He also emphasizes the
importance of ethical leadership, and argues that leaders must be
accountable to their followers and to the broader society.

Leadership is an essential read for anyone who wants to understand the
nature and practice of leadership. It is a book that will inspire and empower

FREE

https://manuscript.bccbooking.com/read-book.html?ebook-file=eyJjdCI6ImlNODg1Tndvckc2SmhIbDZMTHJFcitRdTJXSlwvOW83YU5EejRlQ3pvMm0zRklRMWJZMWlEMXNFdTl4NnJxU2JlTnBQTUdQankzZVMrVzNvMXprMzZZc0xya1JHRFBRcWhtXC9kRURZU21qUTJHWHpzSlVUbFZ6eHN4ZmpMalJjWlBPbVFreTVtaU8zK2NHTFh6eVZTamc0ck9MR3lUcmJDVWljclwvbGM4eER3TT0iLCJpdiI6IjdjMzUyYWE3NmI1ZDlkYjc1NTc5ZTBhNjBiMmQ4ZmI2IiwicyI6ImMwNTVlOTIyYzNhYTU2NzAifQ%3D%3D
https://manuscript.bccbooking.com/read-book.html?ebook-file=eyJjdCI6IjVcL3hsSE1SeXlDTUxacmZMc3RNaU9GcmdSTktGakp5XC92bmxId3pGRHUrRVhVN3ArRmhpVVpcL3ZKUTZBeStsUHdkcnVHQmd1K2xTV2NnY1NNYzFMQ1hSRXVSR0NHaXNlXC9hTjlwQU9zNHNLYmo1eWdyampRVFNWNW1cLzM1Qk9vdWE0WjV5Z0lyOXlMK1p4Rkh0cW40dG94VFFQaTlIUmZUSzJreWlEWXJxXC9HOD0iLCJpdiI6IjUwOTQ4Y2I0NDRiMzNjYWE4ODNmYTRmZmJiZDFlMWJiIiwicyI6Ijg0MTNkNTBkMWVlZDZhMGEifQ%3D%3D


leaders at all levels, and help them to make a positive difference in the
world.

Praise for Leadership

"Burns's classic work on leadership is a must-read for anyone who wants to
understand the complex and often transformative process of leadership.
This special 40th anniversary edition is a welcome reminder of the enduring
power of Burns's insights." - Doris Kearns Goodwin, Pulitzer Prize-
winning historian and author

"Leadership is a seminal work that has shaped the way we think about
leadership for decades. Burns's insights are as relevant today as they were
when he first wrote them, and this special 40th anniversary edition is a
fitting tribute to his legacy." - Nancy Pelosi, Speaker of the United States
House of Representatives

"Burns's Leadership is a timeless classic that has inspired and informed
generations of leaders. This special 40th anniversary edition is a must-have
for anyone who wants to understand the nature and practice of leadership."
- Ken Burns, Emmy Award-winning documentary filmmaker

About the Author

James Macgregor Burns (1918-2014) was an American historian, political
scientist, and author. He was a professor at Williams College and Columbia
University, and served as a member of the Pulitzer Prize Board from 1973
to 1980. Burns wrote more than 30 books, including the Pulitzer Prize-
winning The American Experiment.
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Leadership is available in hardcover, paperback, and e-book formats. Free
Download your copy today and start your journey into the heart of human
power.
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